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**Title:**
East Asia Utilities Corp., et al. v. Joselito Z. Arenas

**Facts:**

1. **Employment and Incident:** Joselito Z. Arenas was hired by East Asia Utilities Corp.
(EAUC) as a Shift Engineer on April 4, 1994, and later promoted to Shift Superintendent on
July 1, 1999. On August 3, 2010, Arenas discovered employee Romeo M. Cabili cutting a
scrapped retainer ring in the company’s maintenance shop.

2.  **Arenas’  Immediate  Actions:**  Arenas  confronted  Cabili  about  the  incident  and
instructed  him  to  return  the  item.  He  shared  the  occurrence  with  other  employees,
indicating it was heard by colleagues including Edward Camus and John Gamalo.

3. **Late Reporting:** Arenas did not immediately file a formal report, instead verbally
sharing the incident with fellow supervisors and subordinates over the subsequent days.

4. **Anonymous Tip:** On August 7, 2010, Plant Manager Noel T. Fernandez was informed
anonymously via text message about Arenas witnessing Cabili’s actions but not reporting it.

5.  **Formal  Investigation and Incident  Report:**  On August  10,  2010,  Arenas verbally
informed Fernandez and, following instructions,  submitted a written incident report on
August 12, 2010.

6. **Employee Behavior Action Review Panel (EBARP) Investigation:** EAUC formed EBARP
to investigate the incident. Three hearings were conducted on August 13, 20, and 23, 2010.

7.  **Recommendation and Dismissal:**  The EBARP recommended Arenas’  dismissal  on
grounds of late reporting, tolerating, and covering up Cabili’s infraction. On September 2,
2010, he was dismissed.

8.  **Cabili’s  Resignation:**  Cabili  resigned  on  September  3,  2010,  acknowledging  his
wrongdoing.

9. **Litigation:** Arenas filed an illegal dismissal complaint. The Labor Arbiter ruled in his
favor, ordering reinstatement and monetary compensation. EAUC appealed to the NLRC,
which  reversed  the  decision,  validating  Arenas’  dismissal  based  on  loss  of  trust  and
confidence. Arenas then appealed to the Court of Appeals, which sided with him, modifying
the decision to include separation pay due to strained relations, and instructed EAUC to pay
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backwages and attorney’s fees.

**Issues:**

1. **Illegal Dismissal:** Whether Joselito Z. Arenas was illegally dismissed by EAUC based
on the actionable grounds of loss of trust and confidence.

2. **Trust and Confidence in Managerial Employees:** The degree of proof required for
establishing loss of trust and confidence in the dismissal of managerial employees.

**Court’s Decision:**

– The Supreme Court initially denied the appeal from EAUC and ruled in favor of Arenas,
emphasizing that his delayed reporting was not characterized by wilfulness or malice, thus
not justifying a loss of trust and confidence.

–  Upon reconsideration of  the motion filed by EAUC and evaluating the evidence,  the
Supreme Court annulled its prior ruling, concluding that Arenas’ failure to promptly and
formally report the incident of alleged theft was enough to undermine trust and confidence
inherent to his managerial position.

– The Court reinstated the NLRC’s decision validating the dismissal, citing that Arenas’ role
demanded vigilance that he failed to adhere to, impacting his employer’s trust.

**Doctrine:**

– **Trust and Confidence Standard:** The dismissal of managerial employees based on loss
of trust does not necessitate proof beyond reasonable doubt; substantiated belief of breach
suffices.  The essential  test  is  whether the employee’s  behavior  warranted a legitimate
erosion of trust by the employer.

**Class Notes:**

– **Article 297(c) of the Labor Code:** Grounds for termination include fraud or willful
breach of trust by the employee (or duly authorized representative).

– **Managerial Trust Benchmark:** Managerial positions entail high trust placement, and
loss of said trust warrants termination if an employee undermines or fails in upholding such
trust.
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**Historical Background:**

In  a  broader  labor  context  within  the  Philippines,  this  case  highlights  the  judiciary’s
interpretation of managerial trust and confidence. The exploration of trust in employment
law  illustrates  the  leniency  given  in  proving  cases  against  upper  managerial  figures,
recognizing  the  employer’s  autonomy  in  determining  continued  employment  amidst
breaches  of  trust.  The  decision  reflects  stringent  standards  placed  upon  each  tier  of
employment hierarchy regarding fidelity and expectations. This case also highlights the
evolution and reinforcement of  trust-based employment doctrines,  which serve as  vital
precedents for future labor-related adjudications in the corporate sphere.


