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Title:
Dily Dany Nacpil vs. International Broadcasting Corporation (G.R. No. 144767)

Facts:
Dily Dany Nacpil served as the Assistant General Manager for Finance/Administration and
Comptroller of International Broadcasting Corporation (IBC) from 1996 until April 1997.
Emiliano Templo replaced Tomas Gomez III as IBC President in March 1997 and purported
to terminate Nacpil’s  services,  attributing previous mismanagement to him and others.
Upon  Templo’s  assumption  as  president,  Nacpil  alleged  he  experienced  workplace
harassment, leading to his forced retirement. However, disputes over the payment of his
retirement benefits arose when Templo refused payment citing the need for clearances and
even challenged Nacpil’s employment status.

Nacpil filed a complaint for illegal dismissal and non-payment of benefits with the Labor
Arbiter in 1997. IBC moved to dismiss, arguing the dispute was intra-corporate and thus
under the Securities and Exchange Commission’s (SEC) jurisdiction. This was denied by the
Labor Arbiter. The Labor Arbiter ruled in Nacpil’s favor, ordering his reinstatement and
damages. IBC’s appeal to the National Labor Relations Commission (NLRC) was dismissed
for lack of an appeal bond. IBC’s motion for reconsideration was also denied.

IBC then filed a petition for certiorari under Rule 65 with the Court of Appeals (CA), which
reversed the rulings of the Labor Arbiter and NLRC and dismissed the complaint. Nacpil’s
motion for reconsideration was denied.

Issues:
1.  Whether  the Labor  Arbiter  had jurisdiction over  Nacpil’s  illegal  dismissal  and non-
payment of benefits complaint.
2. Whether Nacpil was a corporate officer or an ordinary employee.
3. Whether the CA erred in reviewing the NLRC’s decision on the strict application of the
appeal bond requirement.

Court’s Decision:
The  Supreme Court  determined  that  the  Labor  Arbiter  did  not  have  jurisdiction  over
Nacpil’s case because it was an intra-corporate dispute, which at the time fell under the
jurisdiction of the SEC poer Presidential Decree No. 902-A. It hinged on whether Nacpil was
a corporate officer, which they established he was, given his appointment required Board
approval.  The nature of  Nacpil’s  functions did not  change this  status.  This  led to  the
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conclusion that his complaint was of such nature that fell within the SEC’s jurisdiction,
rather than the Labor Arbiter’s.

Additionally, the Supreme Court agreed with the CA that the IBC’s failure to post an appeal
bond did not affect the Labor Arbiter’s lack of jurisdiction over the dispute. The SC affirmed
the Court of Appeals’ decision to dismiss the case without prejudice to filing appropriate
action in the proper court.

Doctrine:
The determination of whether a dispute is intra-corporate, and thus within the jurisdiction of
the securities and dispute mechanisms rather than labor courts, hinges on two factors: the
status or relationship of the parties and the nature of the question that is the subject of their
controversy.

Class Notes:
1. Jurisdiction is conferred by the Constitution or law, not by the consent or act of the
parties.
2. Intra-corporate disputes involve relationships within the corporate structure and typically
fall within the jurisdiction of specialized agencies or courts, such as the SEC or the Regional
Trial Courts.
3. A corporate officer is one whose position requires appointment by the Board of Directors
and has a relationship with the corporation outlined by its by-laws and corporate structure,
as opposed to an ordinary employee.
4. The posting of an appeal bond under Article 223 of the Labor Code is mandatory and
jurisdictional for appealing Labor Arbiter decisions, although irrelevant when the Labor
Arbiter lacks jurisdiction.

Historical Background:
The historical significance of this case lies in its illustration of legal procedures regarding
jurisdictional  disputes  between  labor  and  corporate  laws.  At  the  time  of  the  initial
complaint,  the  SEC  had  jurisdiction  over  intra-corporate  disputes,  as  dictated  by
Presidential Decree No. 902-A. However, by the time of the Supreme Court ruling, the
jurisdiction over such cases had shifted to the Regional Trial Courts under Republic Act No.
8799, or the Securities Regulation Code. The Nacpil  vs.  IBC case reflects the evolving
jurisdictional  boundaries  between  labor  relations  and  corporate  governance  within
Philippine  jurisprudence.


